
CORTLAND COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT - MATERIAL BIDS-2010  

CRUSHED STONE

SUIT SUIT 

MATERIALS KOTE KOTE  ED BEARD CRANESVILLE CASE

POLKVILLE HOMER RMS  BLOCK **

1ST 10.25 NO BID NO BID 15.00

1A 12.75 9.00 8.24 14.75

1 10.00 9.25 9.59 14.75

2 10.25 9.25 9.09 14.75

3 no bid NO BID NO BID 14.75

1 & 1A 11.60 9.25 9.09 14.75

1 & 2 10.40 9.25 8.25 ROUNDS 9.34 15.00

1 1/2" MINUS CRUSHER RUN 11.15

FINE CRUSHER RUN

COURSE CRUSHER RUN

BANK RUN GRAVEL no bid 5.25

SCREENED GRAVEL 6.75 6.50

GABION STONE

#1B: 9.25

LIMESTONE C/RUN 13.75

GRAVEL C/RUN 9.75 7.75

LIME STONE 3A 13.75

W.F.

BINGHAMTON HANSON F.S. SAUNDERS CORTLANDVILE

READY MIX* *** LOPKE * SAND & GRAVEL

1ST 8.00 10.00 no bid 8.00

1A 8.00 11.00 9.00 8.00

1 8.00 10.00 8.75 8.00

2 8.00 10.00 8.75 8.00

3 no bid 10.00 no bid no bid

1 & 1A 8.00 11.00 9.50 8.00

1 & 2 8.00 10.00 9.25 8.00

CRUSHER RUN                                  7.00

2 & 3 CRUSHED STONE

LIMESTONE RUN OF CRUSH

GRAVEL RUN OF CRUSH

FINE & COARSE GRAVEL

CRUSHER RUN 1 1/2   ' MAX

2 SCREENED GRAVEL

BANK RUN GRAVEL

* DIVISION OF W.F. SAUNDERS & SONS, INC.-PLANT LOCATION-LISLE, NY

** DOES NOT MEET SPEC (INCLUDES TRUCKING)

*** PRICES FOR BOTH JAMESVILLE AND SKANEATELES QUARRIES

PLANT LOCATION: PHONE: FAX: CONTACT PERSON:

RMS GRAVEL, INC.

290 MOTT RD. DRYDEN, NY 844-8196 844-3752 CHERYL FORD

DRYDEN. NY 13053 rmsgravel@yahoo.com

BINGHAMTON READY MIX RTE. 11  LISLE

DIV. OF W.F. SAUNDERS & SONS INC. 315-469-3217 315-469-4858 TRACEY SAUNDERS

5126 S. ONONDAGA RD. tsaunders@saundersconcrete.com

NEDROW, NY 13120

SUIT-KOTE CORP.

1911 LORINGS CROSSING RD. 753-1100 758-9760 LORRAINE TITUS

CORTLAND, NY 13045 ltitus@suit-kote.com

F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING INC.

3430 STATE RTE. 434 607-687-1114 607-687-1856 PETER E. FIORINI, JR.

APALACHIN, NY  13732 pefiorini@stny.rr.com

W.F. SAUNDERS & SONS, INC. NEDROW 315-469-3217 315-469-4858 TRACEY SAUNDERS

5126 S. ONONDAGA ROAD tsaunders@saundersconcrete.com

NEDROW, NY 13120

ED BEARD EAST HOMER 607-423-4941 ED BEARD

2617 EAST RIVER RD. beardy@dishmail.com

CORTLAND, NY   13045

HANSON AGGREGATES NEW YORK, INC.

PO BOX 513 315-469-5501 315-469-3133 ROGER HUTCHINSON

JAMESVILLE, NY 13078 roger.hutchinson@hanson.com

CASE TRUCKING

302 PLEASANT VALLEY ROAD 898-4485 898-9571 PEGGY CASE

GROTON, NY 13073 pcase3@twcny.rr.com

CRANESVILL BLOCK 875 STATE RTE 11A 315-478-4101 315-472-3150 ROBERT TOUSEW

434 E. BRIGHTON AVE. TULLY, NY rtousew@cranesville.com

SYRACUSE, NY 13210




