CORTLAND COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT - MATERIAL BIDS-2010

GRAVEL
OPTION OPTION OPTION OPTION OPTION
A B1 B1 B2 B2
PER CU. YD. PER CU. YD. PER TON PER CU. YD. PER TON
E-Z ACRES
CRANESVILLE BLOCK
LEONARD KIMMICK $ 1.50
MONIZ
CVILLES &G $ 2.85 $ 3.15
OPTION A - COUNTY TO OPERATE
OPTION B1 - OWNER CONTROL - COUNTY PROCESS & LOAD CHARGED BY C.Y
OPTION B1 - OWNER CONTROL - COUNTY PROCESS & LOAD CHARGED PER TON
OPTION B2 - OWNER CONTROL - OWNER TO LOAD - CHARGED BY C.Y.
OPTION B2 - OWNER CONTROL - OWNER TO LOAD - CHARGED PER TON
GRAVEL - OPTION C & D - (PER TON) SuIT SUIT KOTE
FS LOPKE C.VILLE** HANSON KOTE HOMER
203.05 SELECT BORROW NO BID
203.06 SELECT FILL $ 7.00 TON
203.07 SELECT GRANULAR FILL $ 7.00  TON
203.0801 SELECT GRAN. FILL PROT. TYPE A $ 10.00 ' TON
203.0802 SELECT GRAN. FILL PRTO. TYPE B $ 10.00 ' TON
203.2 SELECT GRANULAR SUBGRADE $ 7.00 TON
203.21 SELECT STRUCTURE FILL $ 7.00  TON
304.11 SUBBASE COURSE, TYPE 1 $ 410 ? |'$ 7.00 TON  $ 6.75 TON
304.12 SUBBASE COURSE, TYPE 2(OLD ITEM 4) $ 690 ? |'$ 7.00  TON
304.13 SUBBASE COURSE, TYPE 3 $ 410 ? |$ 7.00 TON
304.14 SUBBASE COURSE, TYPE 4 (OLD ITEM 4) $ 6.50 TON | $ 410 ? |'$ 7.00 TON  $ 6.75 TON
605.0901 UNDERDRAIN FILTER, TYPE 1 $ 10.00 | TON $ 10.00 ' TON
605.1001 UNDERDRAIN FILTER, TYPE 11 $ 11.00 | TON $ 11.00 ' TON
605.1101 UNDERDRAIN FILTER, TYPE 111 NO BID
620.08 BEDDING MATERIAL
ALTERNATIVE PRODUCTS
SCREENED GRAVEL $6.75 TON
GRAVEL CRUSHER RUN $8.00 TON
BANK RUN $5.50 TON

GRAVEL - OPTION C & D - (PER TON)




BINGHAMTON
READY MIX SAUNDERS ED BEARD

203.05 SELECT BORROW $4.25 TON $4.25 TON $4.25 TON
203.06 SELECT FILL $4.25 TON $4.25 TON $4.25 TON
203.07 SELECT GRANULAR FILL $4.75 TON $4.75 TON $4.50 TON
203.0801 SELECT GRAN. FILL PROT. TYPE A NO BID NO BID $8.25 TON
203.0802 SELECT GRAN. FILL PRTO. TYPE B NO BID NO BID $8.25 TON
203.2 SELECT GRANULAR SUBGRADE $4.75 TON $4.75 TON $8.25 TON
203.21 SELECT STRUCTURE FILL $4.75 TON $4.75 TON $8.25 TON
304.11 SUBBASE COURSE, TYPE 1 $5.50 TON $5.50| TON |INO BID
304.12 SUBBASE COURSE, TYPE 2(OLD ITEM 4) NO BID NO BID NO BID
304.13 SUBBASE COURSE, TYPE 3 $5.50 TON $5.50| TON INO BID
304.14 SUBBASE COURSE, TYPE 4 (OLD ITEM 4) $5.50 TON $5.50 TON |NO BID
605.0901 UNDERDRAIN FILTER, TYPE 1 $8.00 TON $8.00 TON $8.00) TON
605.1001 UNDERDRAIN FILTER, TYPE 11 $8.00 TON $8.00 TON $6.00 TON
605.1101 UNDERDRAIN FILTER, TYPE 111 $6.00 TON $6.00 TON $7.00 TON
620.08 BEDDING MATERIAL

ALTERNATIVE PRODUCTS

SCREENED GRAVEL

GRAVEL CRUSHER RUN $8.00) TON

BANK RUN $3.25 TON

ITEM 4 $4.75 TON
OPTION D*

PLANT CONTACT
LOCATION: PHONE: FAX: PERSON:
HANSON AGGREGATES NEW YORK LLC
P.0.BOX 513 JAMESVILLE 315-469-5501 315-469-3133 ROGER HUTCHINSON
JAMESVILLE, NY 13078 roger.hutchinson@hanson.com
|

F.S. LOPKE CONTRACTING INC. 607-687-1114 607-687-1856 PETER E. FIORINI, JR.
3430 STATE RTE. 434 pefiorini@stny.rr.com
APALACHIN, NY 13732

|




SUIT-KOTE CORP. RTE. 11 753-1100 758-9760 LORRAINE TITUS‘
1911 LORINGS CROSSING RD. HOMER [titus@suit-kote.com
CORTLAND, NY 13045

CORTLANDVILLE SAND & GRAVEL SOUTH CORTLAN 756-2115 756-2115 RALPH ROE

765 RTE. 13 |

cortlandvillesandgravel@yahoo.com

CORTLAND, NY 13045

LEONARD KIMMICK

678 BABOCOK HOLLOW RD.

MARATHON, NY 13803

BINGHAMTON READY MIX RTE. 11 LISLE 315-469-3217 315-469-4858 TRACEY SAUNDERS

DIV. OF W.F. SAUNDERS & SONS INC. tsaunders@saundersconcrete.com
5126 S. ONONDAGA RD.

W.F. SAUNDERS & SONS, INC. NEDROW 315-469-3217 315-469-4858 TRACEY SAUNDERS

5126 S. ONONDAGA ROAD tsaunders@saundersconcrete.com
NEDROW, NY 13120

ED BEARD EAST HOMER 607-423-4941 ED BEARD

2628 EAST RIVER RD.

beardy@dishmail.net

CORTLAND, NY 13045




