CORTLAND COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT - MATERIAL BIDS-2010

TRANSIT MIX CONCRETE

CORTLAND CRANESVILLE

READY MIX BLOCK
CLASS A 94.00 cy 90.25 cy
CLASS D 98.75 cy 96.25 cy
CLASS E 95.70 cy 92.25 cy
CLASS F 97.70 cy 96.25 cy
CLASS G 97.25 cy 94.25 cy
CLASS H 94.80 cy 94.25 cy
CLASS HP 128.00 cy 128.25 cy
CLASS DP 131.00 cy 131.50 cy
ADD PER MILE OR OVER 5 MILES NO CHARGE 0.15 per mile per load
ADD FOR LOADS UNDER 4 CY 60.00 60.00 per load
WAITING TIME AFTER 30 MIN. 75.00 75.00 per hour

CORTLAND CRANESVILLE

WASTE BLOCKS READY MIX BLOCK

2X2X8 50.00 no bid
2X2X6 45.00 45.00 fob
2X2X4 40.00 no bid

CORTLAND CRANESVILLE
PRECAST CONCRETE BLOCKS READY MIX BLOCK
3X3X3(County to supply hardware) 90.00 50.00
2X2X8 106.00 no bid
2X2X6 71.00 no bid
2X2X4 53.00 no bid

PLANT LOCATION: PHONE: FAX: CONTACT PERSON:

CORTLAND READY MIX 6 LOCUST AVE 315-469-3217 315-469-4858 TRACEY SAUNDERS

DIV. OF WF SAUNDERS

CORTLAND

tsaunders@saundersconcrete.com

PO BOX A

NEDROW, NY 13120-0280

CRANESVILL BLOCK

100 LYNCH ST

315-478-4101

315-472-3150

ROBERT TOUSEW

434 E. BRIGHTON AVE.

SYRACUSE

rtousew@cranesville.com

SYRACUSE, NY 13210




